
BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

ConvergeOne The Horus Group, LLC CDW-G SHI International Corp. Central Technology 

Services

Hypertec USA, Inc. Sunrise Hitek Group, 

LLC

Techcycle Solutions

Overland Park, KS Rowlett, TX Vernon Hills Somerset, NJ NY, NY Tempe, AZ Chicago, IL Overland Park, KS

#1

Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 560.00$                      514.88$                       560.00$                   559.50$                      610.00$                   655.00$                      830.38$                      

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 560.00$                      554.01$                       560.00$                   559.50$                      655.00$                      830.38$                      

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 575.00$                      514.88$                       575.00$                   574.49$                      N/A 830.38$                      

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 585.00$                      514.88$                       585.00$                   584.48$                      797.50$                   655.00$                      830.38$                      

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 620.00$                      569.88$                       620.00$                   619.45$                      723.00$                      830.38$                      

#2

Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 775.00$                      1,219.02$                    775.00$                   774.31$                      1,149.42$                1,397.08$                   

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 775.00$                      1,219.02$                    775.00$                   774.31$                      1,397.08$                   

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 810.00$                      1,388.89$                    810.00$                   809.28$                      1,397.08$                   

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 873.00$                      1,388.89$                    873.00$                   872.22$                      1,336.92$                1,397.08$                   

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 922.00$                      1,494.85$                    922.00$                   921.18$                      1,397.08$                   

# 3

Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE  $                     450.00 369.09$                       450.00$                    $                     450.00 421.59$                    $                     470.00  $                     707.94 

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 450.00$                      369.09$                       450.00$                   450.00$                      470.00$                       $                     707.94 

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 469.00$                      538.96$                       469.00$                   468.98$                      N/A  $                     707.94 

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 479.00$                      538.96$                       479.00$                   478.97$                      584.04$                   648.00$                       $                     707.94 

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 489.00$                      644.92$                       489.00$                   489.07$                      819.00$                       $                     707.94 

#4

Specifications Met

BASE PRICE 756.00$                      770.58$                       756.00$                   756.00$                      1,027.99$                1,079.00$                   1,087.56$                   

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 756.00$                      770.58$                       756.00$                   756.00$                      1,079.00$                   1,087.56$                   

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 791.00$                      940.45$                       791.00$                   790.91$                      N/A 1,087.56$                   

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 854.00$                      940.45$                       854.00$                   853.91$                      1,163.61$                1,257.00$                   1,087.56$                   

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 903.00$                      1,046.41$                    903.00$                   902.87$                      1,428.00$                   1,087.56$                   

#5

Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 889.00$                      945.29$                       889.00$                   889.00$                      1,280.19$                1,379.00$                   1,431.11$                   

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 889.00$                      945.29$                       889.00$                   889.00$                      1,379.00$                   1,431.11$                   

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 924.00$                      1,115.16$                    924.00$                   923.97$                      N/A 1,431.11$                   

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 987.00$                      1,115.16$                    987.00$                   986.91$                      1,467.69$                1,445.00$                   1,431.11$                   

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 1,036.00$                   1,221.12$                    1,036.00$                1,040.41$                   1,521.00$                   1,431.11$                   

6 Monitor 20" E-Series - E2616H (Height Adjust Only) 74.00$                        82.66$                         74.00$                     77.00$                        95.71$                     107.00$                      No Bid 80.21$                        

7 Monitor 22" E-Series - E2216H (Height Adjust Only) 78.00$                        96.45$                         78.00$                     81.00$                        111.65$                   142.00$                      No Bid 102.09$                      

8 Monitor 22" P-Series - P2219H (Height, Tilt, Swivel, Pivot) 109.00$                      151.56$                       109.00$                   113.00$                      174.50$                   332.00$                      No Bid 160.44$                      

9 Monitor 24" P-Series - P2419H (Height, Tilt, Swivel, Pivot) 118.00$                      179.56$                       118.00$                   122.00$                      206.22$                   360.00$                      No Bid 189.61$                      

10
Monitor 22" P-Series - P2219HC (Height, Tilt, Swivel, Pivot) w/USB C

N/A 151.56$                       N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A

11

Monitor 24" P-Series - P2419HC (Height, Tilt, Swivel, Pivot) - w/USB 

C 148.00$                      206.67$                       148.00$                   153.00$                      237.95$                   561.00$                      No Bid 218.78$                      

12 WD19 - DOCK 110.00$                      152.63$                       110.00$                   114.00$                      242.64$                   310.00$                      No Bid 185.52$                      

13 WD19TB - (Thunderbolt) *** New Dock 2019 *** 78.00$                        216.39$                       188.00$                   81.00$                        265.60$                   353.00$                      No Bid 249.52$                      

14 DA3100 - USB Mini Port Replicator 45.00$                        69.90$                         45.00$                     47.00$                        151.29$                   N/A No Bid N/A

15 USB SoundBar AC511 (318-2885) 26.00$                        48.93$                         26.00$                     27.00$                        34.88$                     79.00$                        No Bid 32.35$                        

16 USB Slim DVD+/-RW Drive DW316 (429-AAUX) 25.00$                        36.70$                         25.00$                     26.00$                        46.55$                     N/A No Bid 43.14$                        

17 Portable Backup Hard Drive 1TB (784-BBBE) 64.00$                        60.74$                         65.00$                     66.00$                        N/A 115.00$                      No Bid N/A

18 Optiplex Micro Vertical Stand (482-BBBR) 7.00$                          15.56$                         7.00$                       8.00$                          15.51$                     21.00$                        No Bid 14.37$                        

19 Optiplex Micro VESA Mount (482-BBBP) 20.00$                        22.88$                         20.00$                     21.00$                        65.11$                     86.00$                        No Bid 21.56$                        

20
Optiplex Micro All in One Mount desktop to monitor kit (482-BBBO)

23.00$                        36.40$                         23.00$                     24.00$                        38.84$                     111.00$                      No Bid 71.90$                        

21 Optiplex Micro Console with DVD-RW (492-BBBS) 51.00$                        78.00$                         51.00$                     53.00$                        N/A 68.00$                        No Bid 64.71$                        

22 Wireless Keyboard and Mouse Combo KM714 (332-1396) 63.00$                        70.70$                         63.00$                     65.00$                        77.60$                     103.00$                      No Bid 35.94$                        

23 MS116 Wired Mouse (275-BBBW) 6.00$                          14.84$                         6.00$                       7.00$                          17.05$                     20.00$                        No Bid 15.81$                        

24 KB216 Wired Multi-Media Keyboard English (580-ADJC) 14.00$                        13.72$                         14.00$                     15.00$                        15.51$                     21.00$                        41* 14.37$                        

25 Dell Active pen 34.00$                        49.06$                         34.00$                     36.00$                        50.41$                     46.00$                        No Bid 46.74$                        

26 Dell Premium Active Pen for (5300 2-N-1 Only) PN579X 53.00$                        76.29$                         53.00$                     55.00$                        77.60$                     92.00$                        No Bid 71.90$                        

*substitution

Tech Svs

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
  Bid Tab

RFQ 21/13

Dell Computers

5/26/2020

No Bid

ConvergeOne

OPTIPLEX 3070 MICRO

No Bid

LATITUDE 5510‐WINDOWS‐CLAMSHELL

 No Bid  No Bid 

LATITUDE 3190 - WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL

 No Bid 

LATITUDE 3310 (2N1) - WINDOWS 

 No Bid 

LATITUDE 5300 (2N1)


